Equipment Bid List #£SD112-ETC-22 Results

B&H B&H KeyCode Media KeyCode Media Adorama Adorama
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended
1 6|Blackmagic Design CINEURSAMWCEKG2 Cameras EA. $3,675.00 $22,050.00 $3,776.00 $22,656.00 $3,581.38 $21,488.28
2 6|Fujinon XA205X8.5BRM-K3 Lens EA. $3,990.00 $23,940.00 $5,025.00 $30,150.00 $3,203.00 $19,218.00
3 3|Fujinon MS-01/X1 Lens controllers EA. $1,575.00 $4,725.00 $1,696.00 $5,088.00 $1,702.32 $5,106.96
4 6|Blackmagic Design CINEURSANSVF2 Viewfinders EA. $1,325.00 $7,950.00 $1,363.50 $8,181.00 $1,296.26 $7,771.56
5 9|Manfrotto MVK504XCTALL Tripod EA. $1,202.96 $11,636.64 $1,517.17 $13,654.53 $1,382.84 $12,445.56
6 9| Manfrotto MVAPANBARL Pan bar EA. $59.96 $539.64 $74.00 $666.00 $64.13 $577.17
7 1Studio Technologies Model 5304 Intercom base station EA. No Bid No Bid $845.75 $845.75 | No Bid No Bid
8 1|Eartec MXSSXLR/F 5-pin XLR headset for intercom EA. $80.00 $80.00 $86.00 $86.00 $71.12 $71.12
9 7| Kiloview KVW-E1-S NDI NDI Encoder EA. $387.89 $2,715.23 $316.00 $2,212.00 $436.90 $3,058.30
10 2|Kiloview KV-D300 NDI Decoder EA. $602.89 $1,205.78 $629.00 $1,258.00 [No Bid No Bid
A KVW-D350, Proposed: ~ KVW-D350, Proposed:
Replacement Model Replacement Model
11 2|Aida HD-NDI-200 POV NDI camera EA. $360.00 $720.00 $382.00 $764.00 $358.11 $716.22
12 1[Rane AD 225 Audio delay EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 2|Blackmagic Design VHUBSMART6G1212 Matrix Switcher EA. $1,192.66 $2,385.32 $1,255.50 $2,511.00 $1,193.58 $2,387.16
14 2| Laird SDI-2BNC-250 Dual SDI cable EA. $569.95 $1,139.90 $645.00 $1,290.00 $394.49 $788.98
15 4|Remote Audio CASNAV100 Dual 100' SDI cable w/ XLR EA. $297.01 $1,188.04 $309.00 $1,236.00 $278.06 $1,112.24
16 3|Remote Audio CASNAV050 Dual 50' SDI cable w/ XLR EA. $193.20 $579.60 $204.00 $612.00 $163.09 $489.27
17 9|Bayco SL-745L 100" Extension cord EA. $75.50 $679.50 $76.00 $684.00 | No Bid No Bid
18 9|Comprehensive CAT6-100BLK 100' Cat6 cable EA. $29.40 $264.60 $48.40 $435.60 $27.64 $248.76
19 3|Kramer C-UNIKAT-200 200 Caté6 cable EA. $89.00 $267.00 $150.00 $450.00 $88.24 $264.72
20 3|Netgear (GS308PP-100NAS PoE ethernet switch EA. $79.99 $239.97 $104.00 $312.00|No Bid No Bid
21 15|Apantac DA-2HD Passive SDI splitter EA. $104.49 $1,567.35 $112.50 $1,687.50 $101.91 $1,528.65
22 1|Canare 5VS03A-5C 5-cable sdi EA. $79.95 $79.95 $91.39 $91.39 $74.42 $74.42
23 15 |Pearstone SDI-1001.5 1.5" sdi cable EA. $5.56 $83.40 $5.91 $88.65 $5.52 $82.80
24 7 |Studio Technologies M373A Dante belt pack EA. No Bid No Bid $395.25 $2,766.75 |No Bid No Bid
25 1Studio Technologies M5421 Dante Intercom Engine EA. No Bid No Bid $1,015.75 $1,015.75 [No Bid No Bid
26 9|Eartec MXD4XLR/F 4-pin XLR headset for intercom EA. $91.20 $820.80 $101.00 $909.00 $82.35 $741.15
27 3|Blackmagic Design CONVMSDIDA4K 1x8 SDI splitter EA. $272.42 $817.26 $284.00 $852.00 $269.52 $808.56
28 1{SKB 1SKB-R1906 Rack with wheels EA. $345.00 $345.00 $363.74 $363.74 $276.11 $276.11
29 1{sKB. 15KB-R106 Rack EA. $260.00 $260.00 $303.74 $303.74 $225.04 $225.04
30 1| Wellmax WM30370 Hand truck cart EA. No Bid No Bid $92.00 $92.00| No Bid No Bid
31 3|Panasonic AW-UE20KP PTZ cameras EA. $1,840.19 $5,520.57 $1,770.00 $5,310.00 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
32 1|Cerevo CDP-FT01B Wireless tally EA. $605.27 $605.27 $664.00 $664.00|No Bid No Bid
33 1|Sennheiser EM-XSW 1 DUAL-A Studio wireless microphone reciever EA. $233.00 $233.00 $299.00 $299.00 $248.19 $248.19
34 2|Sennheiser SK-XSW-A Wireless mic body packs EA. $87.00 $174.00 $112.00 $224.00 $92.81 $185.62
35 2|senal oLM-2 lavalier mic EA. $39.99 $79.98 $70.83 $141.66 $247.50 $495.00
36 3|Studio Technologies M373A Dante belt pack EA. No Bid No Bid $395.25 $1,185.75 [ No Bid No Bid
37 3|Eartec MXDAXLR/F 4-pin XLR headset for intercom EA. $91.20 $273.60 $103.00 $309.00 $82.35 $247.05
38 1|Studio Technologies M5421 Dante Intercom Engine EA. No Bid No Bid $1,015.75 $1,015.75 [ No Bid No Bid
39 3|Prompter People ROBO JR PTZ teleprompter EA. $2,750.00 $8,250.00 $2,681.00 $8,043.00 $2,205.35 $6,616.05
40 1|Cerevo CDP-FTO1B Wireless tally EA. $605.27 $605.27 $664.00 $664.00 | No Bid No Bid
41 2|Lilliput Q17-ABBP Studio Monitor EA. $1,320.00 $2,640.00 $1,462.00 $2,924.00 $1,282.35 $2,564.70
42 3|canon 4839C001 PTZ Cam with NDI EA. $4,845.00 $14,535.00 $5,129.00 $15,387.00 $5,028.20 $15,084.60
43 1Blackmagic Design HYPERD/ST/DCHP 4K recorder EA. $592.33 $592.33 $660.00 $660.00 $594.65 $594.65
44 1|ProGrade PGSD128GBCK2BH SD card 2 pack EA. $240.00 $240.00 $259.99 $259.99 $242.35 $242.35
EA.
BigFoot Mobile Rack with options for expanded production
capabilities. Filmmaker Double Rack Consisting of:
1)ANODIZEDALUMINUMFRAMED, (STDSILVERANDBLACK)
2)8”BCWHDNO-
45% 1|BigFoot BF-22RU/25D (See Description) FLATWHEELS,4SWIVELWHEELS 4BRAKESTWORIGIDLOCKINGCAP [EA. No Bid No Bid $3,515.00 $3,515.00 | No Bid No Bid
ABLEFORDUALMODEOPERATION
3)8RUXOFRACKBELOW&3RUX2ABOVE43"DRAWER
4)INCLUDESLIFTOUTRACKPANELS/SIDES(STDHI-TECHPLASTICS)
5)HDSTEERINGHANDLESONBOTHENDS
a6* 1[sigroot BF-STORAGE LID o rint o asmorirooe et amusrsoie onzosoue | |NoBd No 8id $616.00 $616.00|No 8id No 8id
a7 1 BigFoot BF-43" DRAWER ?;;\KNEIVDJOTQ?)?f.i?fﬁsushfg‘c%ik@v szkci%?;ormcnorvs A No Bid No Bid ABD | "o Bid No Bid
48* 2|BigFoot BF-FLIP-UP SIDEPNL BIGFOOT CART SIDE PANEL FLIP UP TABLE EA. No Bid No Bid $202.00 $404.00 | No Bid No Bid




49* 1|BigFoot BF-PALLETING PALLETING AND PACKAGING FEE EA. No Bid No Bid $604.00 $604.00 | No Bid No Bid
50* 1|BigFoot BF- DESIGN DESIGNDRAWING FOR BUILD EA. No Bid No Bid $0.00 | No Bid No Bid
Arcadia Central Station scalable i.p.-based intercom system:
- (16) Licensed Ports, 1RU ! , ,
51 1|Clear-Com ARCADIA-X4-16P ) ) > o EA. No Bid No Bid $11,336.00 $11,336.00 | No Bid No Bid
with HelixNet, 4-wire, 2-wirewith Power Supply,
Dante, 4 pin XLR-Male headset
FreeSpeak Il Beltpack: 1.9GHz, US with -5 assignable keys, 4 pin
XLR-Male headsetincludes BAT60 battery. Regulatory MODEL:
BP1G9 " " "
52*%% 2|Clear-C FSII-BP19-X4-US EA. No Bid No Bid 1,836.00 3,672.00 | No Bid No Bid
ear-tom Freespeak Il Beltpack: 1.9GHz, US with -5 o8 o B $ $ o B o B
assignable keys, 4 pin XLR-Male headsetlncludes
BAT60 battery. Regulatory MODEL: BP1G9
Clear-com FSlI Transceiver adapter part 453G023. FCC approved
for use in the USA and Canada. Clear-com FSII Transceiver
adapter part 453G023. FCC approved for use in the USA and
Canada.
53+* Clear-C -TCVR-19- EA. No Bid No Bid 1,678. .00 |No Bid No Bid
2|Clear-Com FSITCVR-19-US Clear-com FSlI Transceiver adapter part 453G023. o8l o8l STEET L2228  No B o8l
FCC approved for use in the USA and Canada. Clear
-com FSII Transceiver adapter part 453G023. FCC
approved for use in the USA and Canada.
54%% 1|Clear-Com AC60 FreeSpeak Il Charger EA. No Bid No Bid $608.00 $608.00 | No Bid No Bid
55%* 2|Clear-Com BAT60 Freespeak || Battery EA. No Bid No Bid $68.00 $136.00| No Bid No Bid
HelixNet Digital 2 ch. Dual listen monaural beltpack: HelixNet
digital two-channel dual listen monaural beltpack with a
56 4|Clear-Com HXII-BP-X4 :‘[‘f‘:‘:""a“ OLED display and four-pin male headset connector. f, No Bid No Bid $981.00 $3,924.00 |No Bid No Bid
a three-pin female XLR for Digital PL and an RJ-45 etherC
ON PoE intercom line connector.
Clear-Com headsets: Single Ear, Medium weight, XLR (F) 4 pin
with Dynamic
Mic, Boom switch. Inc. headset bag For use with standard (-X4)
Clear-Com intercom stations
57+% Clear-C -300- EA. No Bid No Bid 28, 1,968.00 |No Bid No Bid
6|Clear-Com €c-300-x4 Headset: Single Ear, Medium weight, XLR (F) 4 pin o8l o B $328.00 »1,963.00| No Bi o Bi
with Dynamic Mic, Boom switch. Inc. headset bag
For use with standard (-X4) Clear-Com intercom
stations
58** 2|Clear-Com AD-12B Surface Mount Male Mic Flange 5/8 inch-27 Thread EA. No Bid No Bid $17.00 $34.00 | No Bid No Bid
5088 1|K&M 22140.500.55 K&M 221 d Table Flange - Base with 3/8" Connector EA. No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 | No Bid No Bid
60** 1|Clear-Com Clear-Com shipping EA. No Bid No Bid $200.00 $200.00| No Bid No Bid
61** 1|KCM Services installation & commissioning installation, commissioning, integration materials EA. No Bid No Bid $1,780.00 $1,780.00 | No Bid No Bid
62 1|Behringer 000-CE802-00010 i:‘p’;:f:’ ABQO Professional 800W Reference-Class Power £A. No Bid No Bid $338.26 $338.26 $225.24 $225.24
63 3|E-Image EI-7903-A E-Image Air-Assist Pedestal with Height-Adjustment Lever EA. $3,435.00 $10,305.00 $3,871.12 $11,613.36 $3,575.66 $10,726.98
64 1canon 5077C010 [anon FOSRS € Mirorless Cinema Camera with 24-105 f/4L ¢, $5,083.15 $5,083.15 $4,950.84 $4,950.84 $5,151.13 $5,151.13
65 1|canon 5050002 Canon RF 100-400mm f/5.6-8 IS USM Lens EA. $598.90 $598.90 $649.99 $649.99 $624.10 $624.10
66 1{Canon 2971C002 Canon Mount Adapter EF-EOS R EA. $89.90 $89.90 $99.99 $99.99 $82.14 $82.14
67 2[NewTek TC1 Newtek Tricaster TC1 EA. $22,125.00 $44,250.00 $13,654.00 $27,308.00 $15,304.25 $30,608.50
68 2 |Newtek TC1SP Newtek Tricaster TC1 14-button control panel EA. Bid as part of total cost (Above) |Bid as part of total cost (Above) $6,227.00 $12,454.00 $6,989.45 $13,978.90
69 2[NewTek PTUTCL NewTek Pro-Tek Ultra for TC1 EA. $1,545.34 $3,090.68 $2,343.00 $4,686.00 [No Bid No Bid
70 2|Newtek PTUTCISP NewTek ProTek Ultra for Tricaster TC1SP EA. $727.51 $1,455.02 $764.00 $1,528.00 [No Bid No Bid
71 2[NewTek RR2RU3RU NewTek Rack Rails EA. $253.96 $507.92 $288.00 $576.00 $252.41 $504.82
72 2| Auray ERS-8U Auray ERS-8U Steel Rack with 3" Casters EA. $90.00 $180.00 $133.32 $266.64| No Bid No Bid
73 12|BirdDog BDFLEXENC BirdDog Flex 4K HDMI In to Full NDI Encoder EA. $373.37 $4,480.44 $386.10 $4,633.20 $365.22 $4,382.64
B IA BZ: " DR 4 D | LED
7 1[sony FW438730) SD‘i’S":IavRAV A B230) 43" Class HOR 4k UHD Commercial [PS e $640.00 $640.00 $718.53 $718.53 $752.39 $752.39
75 4|Audinate Dante Virtual Soundcard Dante Virtuak Soundcard for ip-based audio EA. $46.08 $184.32 $48.88 $195.52 $53.47 $213.88
76 6[1BL 308P MKII 1BL 308P MKl - Powered 8" Two-Way Studio Monitor EA. $180.00 $1,080.00 | No Bid No Bid $228.31 $1,369.86
77 4|Birdbog BDP240B 2:33‘3 P240 40X Full NDI PTZ Camera with HOMI/3G-SDI EA. $2,588.51 $10,354.04 $2,699.00 $10,796.00 $2,565.99 $10,263.96
78 1|BirdDog BDAKQUAD BirdDog 4K Quad NDI Encoder/Decoder EA. $1,808.50 $1,808.50 $1,889.00 $1,889.00 $1,276.15 $1,276.15
79 1{SKAARHO) PTZ-EXTREME-V2 SKAARHOJ PTZ Extreme 2020 IP Camera Controller EA. $3,960.15 $3,960.15 $4,049.00 $4,049.00 $3,413.15 $3,413.15
80 1] Netgear MS510TXPP-100NAS Netgear MSS10TXPP 8 Port Gigabit PoE Managed Switch EA. No Bid No Bid $595.60 $595.60 $294.42 $294.42




Jackreel MKR-TC6-150PS Connect-N-Go DataTuff Belden 7953A

-TC6- EA. . . . R i i
81 4|Jackreel MKR-TC6-150PS Cat6 Cable Reel With Proshell Connector - 150 Foot $383.00 $1,532.00 $398.95 $1,595.80 [No Bid No Bid
82 1[Blackmagic Design SWATEMMXEPBPRISO Blackmagic Design ATEM SDI Pro ISO Switcher EA. $679.00 $679.00 $716.00 $716.00 $680.21 $680.21
83 1|Sandisk SDSSDE61-4T00-G25 SanDisk 4TB Extreme Portable SSD V2 EA. No Bid No Bid $366.66 $366.66 $327.39 $327.39
EA.
1|Newtek FG-003244-R001 Newtek NC2 Studio 1/0 Module EA. $10,584.51 $10,584.51 $10,796.00 $10,796.00 | No Bid No Bid
1|Newtek PTU-000000037 ProTek Ultra Coverage for NC2 I/O EA. $1,244.03 $1,244.03 $1,156.00 $1,156.00 [ No Bid No Bid
1|KCM Services TSPRO-17 Installation of Newtek NC2 Studio I/0 Module EA. No Bid (See Alt. Below) No Bid (See Alt. Below) $1,440.00 $1,440.00 | No Bid No Bid
Alt: Newtek Professional Services Plan (for Istallation - 4 Hours) ~EA. $856.64 $856.64 N/A N/A N/A N/A
Alt: Newtek Professional Services Plan (for Istallation - 10 Hours) EA. $2,146.00 $2,146.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A
1/AA KUMO-3232 AJAKUMO 3232 Compact 3G-SDI Router (2 RU) EA. $3,589.95 $3,589.95 $3,959.00 $3,959.00 $3,202.20 $3,202.20
1skaarhoj RACK-FLY-DUO-V1 Skaarhoj Rack Fly Duo Universal Control Panel EA. 2401.92 $2,401.92 $2,375.12 $2,375.12 1967.06 $1,967.06
1|Apantac DA-HDTV-5DI HDMI to SDI Converter EA. 585.69 $585.69 $595.00 $595.00 | No Bid No Bid
Dell OptiPlex XE4 Tower Intel Core i9-12900 - 64GB RAM -
2TBSSDDell OptiPlex XE4 Tower Intel Core i9-
12900(16Cores/30MB/24T/2.4GHz to 5.1GHz/65W)Windows11
Pro64 GBM.2 2280 2TB PCle NVMe Class 405olid State
DrivenVidia GeForce RTX3070 8GBNORAIDS00 W internal power ' '
1Dell 210-BDER EA. 4,441.00 4,441.00 768. 768.00 | No Bid No Bid
© supply unitSystem PowerCord8x DVD+/-RW 9.5mm Slimline 54 54 ESZeE 0y B0 No B o B
Optical DiskDrivelntel Wi-Fi 6E 2x2 AX211 Bluetooth 5.2
WirelessCardKeyboardMouseBasic Onsite Service
36MonthsProSupport and Next Business Day OnsiteService
Initial, 36 Month(s)
1|Thor H-SDI-PG Thor F-SDI-PG Portable SD/HD/3G-SDI Pattern Generator EA. $336.00 $336.00 $354.24 $354.24No Bid No Bid




