
Equipment Bid List #ESD112-ETC-23 Results
B&H B&H KeyCode Media KeyCode Media

Qt Manuf Model Desc. Cost Extended Cost Extended

1 5 M-Audio BX4PAIRBTXUS Speakers to monitor program audio EA. $133.49 $667.45 $152.15 $760.75

2 4 Ikan LBX20 LED light panel EA. $1,125.00 $4,500.00 $1,189.15 $4,756.60

3 1 Sony UWP-D26/25 Wireless camera lavalier and handheld mic transmitter EA. $698.00 $698.00 $719.99 $719.99

4 2 Marshall VS-PTC-IP PTZ Controller EA. $907.27 $1,814.54 $984.77 $1,969.54

5 3 Canon 4839C001 PTZ Cam with NDI EA. $4,376.38 $13,129.14 $4,487.12 $13,461.36

6 6 Lenovo

90V7004LUS

3.0 GHz Intel Core i9 24-Core (13th Gen)

32GB of 5600 MHz DDR5 RAM

NVIDIA GeForce RTX 4080 (16GB GDDR6X)

1TB M.2 NVMe PCIe SSD

2.5 GbE RJ45 LAN

Wi-Fi 6E (802.11ax) | Bluetooth 5.1

HDMI 2.1 | DisplayPort 1.4a

CPU Liquid Cooler | RGB Lighting

Includes USB Keyboard and Mouse

Windows 11 Home

Desktop PC for graphics and vMix EA. $2,179.00 $13,074.00 $2,199.00 $13,194.00

7 2 vMix SCSI-VMIX-PRO  Switcher and Replay software EA. $1,002.54 $2,005.08 $1,071.60 $2,143.20

8 1 Lenovo

83C00004US

2.6 GHz Intel Core i9 (13th Gen)

32GB LPDDR5x RAM | 1TB M.2 SSD

16" 3200 x 2000 Mini-LED Touchscreen

NVIDIA GeForce RTX 4060 (8GB GDDR6)

4-in-1 SD Card Reader

Thunderbolt 4 | USB-A 3.2 Gen 1 | HDMI

Wi-Fi 6E (802.11ax) | Bluetooth 5.1

6 x Stereo Speaker System with Woofers

5MP Infrared Webcam

Windows 11 Home

Laptop EA. $1,795.00 $1,795.00 $1,769.00 $1,769.00

9 8 Acer UM.HB2AA.005 Computer monitor EA. $149.00 $1,192.00 $161.49 $1,291.92

10 1 Yamaha MS101-4 Powered speaker EA. $110.96 $110.96 $122.39 $122.39

11 1 Mackie M48 Phantom power for microphone EA. $41.43 $41.43 $50.99 $50.99

12 1 Kopul MUTEMATE-2X2 Push to talk button EA. $27.51 $27.51 $40.99 $40.99

13 1 Shure CVG18D-B/C Gooseneck mic EA. $132.71 $132.71 $137.56 $137.56

14 2 Yongnuo YN360 IIC Accent lights EA. $106.50 $213.00 $116.44 $232.88

15 2 Blackmagic Design CONVMUDCSTD/HD Up/Down/Cross converter EA. $138.01 $276.02 $143.10 $286.20

16 2 Global Truss TRUSS SYSTEM Lighting truss EA. $799.00 $1,598.00 $989.92 $1,979.84

17 6 Ikan LBX30 LED light panel EA. $1,378.00 $8,268.00 $1,609.30 $9,655.80

18 4 Impact CC-106R Clamp EA. $14.96 $59.84 $16.76 $67.04

19 1 American DJ DMX-OPERATOR DMX controller EA. $115.00 $115.00 $119.67 $119.67

20 2 Dedolight CLAMP-S Drop ceiling clamp EA. $36.75 $73.50 $41.65 $83.30

21 1 American DJ AC5PDMX50 50' DMX cables EA. $24.00 $24.00 $37.76 $37.76

22 5 American DJ AC5PDMX10 10' DMX cables EA. $9.78 $48.90 $12.56 $62.80

23 4 Sony SRG-A40 4K PTZ Camera with NDI EA. $2,377.16 $9,508.64 $3,079.30 $12,317.20

23B 4 Sony SRGA40/N
Sony SRG-A40/N 4K PTZ Camera with NDI|HX, Built in 

AI, and 20x Optical Zoom (Black)
EA. $2,661.58 $10,646.32

24 4 Newtek Compatible with SRG-A40 (#SW-000000005) NDI | HX license for cameras EA. $259.53 $1,038.12 $263.12 $1,052.48

25 3 Magnus VT-5000 Tripod EA. $169.00 $507.00 $228.65 $685.95

26 3 Magnus DSF-132 Wheels for tripod EA. $149.00 $447.00 $186.99 $560.97

27 3 DataVideo TP-900 PTZ Teleprompter EA. $1,260.16 $3,780.48 $1,319.12 $3,957.36

28 2 Shure BLX188/CVL-J11 Wireless microphones EA. $479.00 $958.00 $522.07 $1,044.14

29 1 X-Keys XK-1456-124VS-BU Switcher surface EA. $794.18 $794.18 $769.45 $769.45

30 5 Blackmagic Design BDLKHCPRO8K12G I/O video card EA. $646.66 $3,233.30 $633.25 $3,166.25

31 2 Blackmagic Design CINECAMPOCHDMFT4K Filmmaking camera EA. $1,124.06 $2,248.12 $1,100.75 $2,201.50

32 2 Metabones MBSPEF-M43-BT8 Lens adapter EA. $596.75 $1,193.50 $636.02 $1,272.04

33 2 DJI CP.OS.00000146.01 Pocket Gimbal EA. $299.99 $599.98 $307.12 $614.24

34 2 Amaran AP30232A14 RGB LED Light mat EA. $479.00 $958.00 $557.07 $1,114.14

35 13 Kiloview N5 NDI Encoder/Decoder EA. $391.83 $5,093.79 $398.65 $5,182.45

36 1 Blackmagic Design CINEURSAMWC6KG2 Broadcast camera EA. $3,641.26 $3,641.26 $3,481.85 $3,481.85

37 1 Manfrotto MVK504XCTALL Tripod EA. $1,186.00 $1,186.00 $1,465.36 $1,465.36

38 8 Studio Technologies Model 204 announcer console EA. No Bid No Bid $716.00 $5,728.00

39 8 Audio-Technica BPHS1 Announcer Headset EA. $139.00 $1,112.00 $175.20 $1,401.60

40 2 Studio Technologies 544D Dante to analog audio converter EA. No Bid No Bid $636.00 $1,272.00

41 4 Lilliput PVM210S Professional video monitor EA. $509.99 $2,039.96 $509.15 $2,036.60

42 2 Laird SDI-2BNC-25 SDI-2BNC-25 Dual SDI Snake EA. $78.89 $157.78 $573.19 $1,146.38

43 4 Canare CAL55CUHD300 300' BNC Cable EA. $222.43 $889.72 $217.46 $869.84

44 1 Q5X QG-H2-US MicCommander Wireless Mic controller EA. No Bid No Bid $875.60 $875.60

45 1 Q5X QT-5100 RefMicHD Referee Microphone pack EA. No Bid No Bid $2,635.60 $2,635.60

46 1 Shure TL45B/O-LEMO Lavalier Mic EA. $299.00 $299.00 $335.16 $335.16

47 1 Q5X QR-M3 Mobile Receiver Reciever EA. No Bid No Bid $1,705.25 $1,705.25

48 1 Audix CBLM25 Mini-XLR to XLR EA. $16.87 $16.87 $23.78 $23.78

49 1 Broadcast Gear WRCU Wireless tally and shading EA. No Bid No Bid $2,585.54 $2,585.54

50 1 Blueshape BLS-MV2AB V-Mount Plate with Gold Mount Adapter EA. $121.00 $121.00 $441.00 $441.00



51 3 Sportzcast Scorelink+ Automated score machine EA. No Bid No Bid $1,999.00 $5,997.00

52 2 Blackmagic Design CONVMOF12G SDI to Fiber converter EA. $143.22 $286.44 $140.25 $280.50

53 2 Blackmagic Design ADPT-3GBI/OPT Fiber modules EA. $118.27 $236.54 $116.76 $233.52

54 2 StarTech MCM1110MMLC Fiber to Ethernet adapter EA. $78.19 $156.38 $99.99 $199.98

55 2 Oben MM-100 Magnetic camera mount EA. $19.95 $39.90 $23.99 $47.98

56 1 Rapco Horizon LTIGLBLOX 3.5mm to XLR interface EA. $54.24 $54.24 $59.49 $59.49

57 2 Shure SM137-LC microphones EA. $119.00 $238.00 $136.08 $272.16

58 1 Allen & Heath AH-QU-16C Audio Mixer EA. $1,494.01 $1,494.01 $1,624.99 $1,624.99

59 2 Pearstone PM-TRSXF25 Female XLR to 1/4" audio cables EA. $11.21 $22.42 $11.96 $23.92

60 1 Lenovo

21JK0054US

Intel Core i7-1360P 12-Core (13th Gen)

32GB DDR4 RAM | 1TB PCIe 4.0 x4 SSD

14" 1920 x 1200 IPS Touchscreen

Integrated Intel Iris Xe Graphics

Thunderbolt 4 | USB-C 3.2 Gen 2

USB-A 3.2 Gen 1 | USB-A 2.0 | HDMI 2.1

Wi-Fi 6 (802.11ax) | Bluetooth 5.1

Gigabit Ethernet Port

1080p Webcam, Dual 2W Speakers & Mics

Windows 11 Pro (64-Bit)

Laptop
EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

60B

(Replacement if 60 is 

unavailable, priority will be given 

to bidder offering 60)

1 Lenovo

82VB0000US 

Intel Core i7 14-Core (12th Gen) 

32GB LPDDR5 RAM | 1TB M.2 PCIe 3.0 SSD 

16" 2560 x 1600 120 Hz IPS Touchscreen 

Intel Arc A370M Graphics (4GB GDDR6) 

Thunderbolt 4 | USB 3.2 Gen 1 | HDMI 

HD IR Webcam 

Dual Speakers & Mic Array 

Windows 11 Home 

Laptop EA. $879.68 $879.68 $899.00 $899.00

61 1 Blackmagic Design SWATEMSCN2/1ME1/HD Video Switcher EA. $863.66 $863.66 $845.75 $845.75

62 2 Rode NTG2 Shotgun mic EA. $159.00 $318.00 $215.20 $430.40

63 2 On-Stage Stands LSMS7620 Mic stand EA. $54.99 $109.98 $48.57 $97.14

64 1 3Dio FS Binaural microphone EA. No Bid No Bid $363.09 $363.09

65 1 NewTek TC1 Newtek Tricaster TC1 EA. $14,075.60 $14,075.60

66 1 Newtek TC1SP Newtek Tricaster TC1 14-button control panel EA. $6,419.60 $6,419.60

67 5 Netwek LivePanel Newtek LivePanel Browser-Based Graphics Interface EA. $863.66 $4,318.30 $845.75 $4,228.75

68 1 NewTek PTUTC1 NewTek Pro-Tek Ultra for TC1 EA. $1,644.86 $1,644.86 $671.25 $671.25

69 1 Newtek PTUTC1SP NewTek ProTek Ultra for Tricaster TC1SP EA. $776.86 $776.86 $671.25 $671.25

70 1 NewTek Training Full day of training (remote training) EA. $1,731.66 $1,731.66 $1,695.75 $1,695.75

71 1 NewTek RR2RU3RU NewTek Rack Rails EA. $256.06 $256.06 $250.75 $250.75

72 4 BirdDog BD4KHDMI BirdDog 4K HDMI 2.0 NDI Encoder/Decoder EA. $823.73 $3,294.92 $825.63 $3,302.52

73 1 Sony FW43BZ30J
Sony BRAVIA BZ30J 43" Class HDR 4K UHD 

Commercial IPS LED Display
EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73B

(Replacement if 73 is 

unavailable, priority will be given 

to bidder offering 73)

1 Sony FW43BZ30L 
Sony BRAVIA BZ30L 43" Class HDR 4K UHD 

Commercial Monitor 
EA. $579.00 $579.00 $610.60 $610.60

74 1 Audinate Dante Virtual Soundcard (Transferable License) Dante Virtual Soundcard for ip-based audio EA. No Bid No Bid $71.99 $71.99

75 2 Atomos ATOMSUMSE1
Atomos Sumo 19" SE HDR Monitor, Recorder, and 

Switcher
EA. $1,645.00 $3,290.00 $1,695.75 $3,391.50

76 6 Atomos ATOMXMINI1000PK Angelbird AtomX SSDmini (1TB) EA. $196.55 $1,179.30 $343.91 $2,063.46

77 6 Atomos ATOMXSSDH1 Atomos Handle Adapter for AtomX SSDmini (5-Pack) EA. $31.68 $190.08 $31.02 $186.12

78 4 Cisco CBS110-8T-D-NA
Cisco CBS110-8T-D 110 Series Unmanaged 8-Port 

Desktop Ethernet Switch
EA. No Bid No Bid $54.30 $217.20

79 1 Gator G-LCD-TOTE-SMX2
Gator LCD Tote Series Transport Bag for Dual Screens 

(19 to 24")
EA. $99.99 $99.99 $110.99 $110.99

80 1 PortaCom COM-60FC-S PortaCom COM-60FCS 6 Headset Intercom System EA. $2,359.99 $2,359.99 $2,799.20 $2,799.20

81 9 Ozen OZ-6AL2HD
OZEN 6AL2HD 75mm Aluminum Tripod & Agile 6 Fluid 

Head System (E-Z-Load)
EA. $1,149.99 $10,349.91 $1,163.46 $10,471.14

82 3 Acebil D-3 Acebil D3 Dolly for Professional Tripods EA. $145.00 $435.00 $151.20 $453.60

83 9 Panasonic AG-CX350PJ5 Panasonic AG-CX350 4K Camcorder EA. $3,347.23 $30,125.07 $3,275.90 $29,483.10

84 9 Newtek FG-001997-R001 NewTek NDI|HX Upgrade for Panasonic Cameras EA. $259.53 $2,335.77 $254.15 $2,287.35

85 9 Varizoom VZ-ROCK
VariZoom VZ-Rock Variable Rocker for LANC 

Camcorders
EA. $166.00 $1,494.00 $211.65 $1,904.85

86 9 PortaBrace CAR-3CAMT
PortaBrace CAR-3CAMT Cargo Case Camera Edition 

(Black)
EA. $207.00 $1,863.00 $229.44 $2,064.96

87 27 Panasonic AG-VBR59P
Panasonic 7.28V 43Wh Lithium-Ion Battery for DVX200 

and CX10 
EA. $176.31 $4,760.37 $174.25 $4,704.75

88 3 Panasonic AG-BRD50P
Panasonic Battery Charger for AG-VBR & Other 

Batteries
EA. $212.25 $636.75 $205.70 $617.10

89 1
Bigfoot Mobile 

Systems
SideOperator XL

SideOperator XL mobile rack with hinged monitor, flip-

up side panels, one articulating monitor mount
EA. No Bid No Bid $5,332.16 $5,332.16

90 4 IDX DUO-C150P
IDX System Technology DUO-C150P 145Wh High-

Load Li-Ion V-Mount Battery
EA. $218.00 $872.00 $307.12 $1,228.48

91 1 Sachtler 4585
Sachtler Flowtech 75 MS Carbon Fiber Tripod with Mid-

Level Spreader and Rubber Feet
EA. $1,389.00 $1,389.00 $1,668.00 $1,668.00

92 1 Ozen AG-8 OZEN Agile 8 Fluid Head EA. $1,012.00 $1,012.00 $1,065.19 $1,065.19

93 1 Atomos ATOMSHSTU2
Atomos Shogun Studio II Rackmount 4K Dual Recorder 

& Monitor (3RU)
EA. $2,375.00 $2,375.00 $2,246.25 $2,246.25

94 2 Chauvet OVATIONREVEE3
CHAUVET PROFESSIONAL Ovation Rêve E-3 

Multicolor LED Ellipsoidal (Black)
EA. $1,817.38 $3,634.76 $1,889.10 $3,778.20

95 1 CAME-TV 3FTR-MK2-4
CAME-TV Boltzen Andromeda MKII RGB LED Tube 

Light (3', 4-Light Kit )
EA. $1,115.00 $1,115.00 $1,140.48 $1,140.48

96 2 Chauvet OHDZOOM2550
CHAUVET PROFESSIONAL 25-50 Degree Ovation HD 

Zoom Lens (Without Light Engine)
EA. $509.95 $1,019.90 $530.08 $1,060.16

97 2 Sennheiser HMD26-II-600-8
Sennheiser HMD 26-II-600-8 Dynamic Broadcast 

Headset
EA. $345.00 $690.00 $382.46 $764.92

98 2 ClearCom FSII-BP19-X4-US
FreeSpeak II Beltpack for ClearCom Arcadia Wireless 

Intercom
EA. No Bid No Bid $1,605.00 $3,210.00

$22,126.00 (Bundled) $22,126.00 (Bundled)



99 2 Atomos ATOMNJAV01 Atomos Ninja V 5" 4K HDMI Recording Monitor EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

99C (Replacement option if 99 

unavailable, priority will be given 

to bidder offering 99)

2 Atomos ATOMSHG002 Atomos Shogun 7" 4K HDMI Recording Monitor EA. $856.29 $1,712.58 $999.00 $1,998.00

100 4 Atomos ATOMSSD05G Atomos Nextorage AtomX SSDmini (500GB) EA. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100B (Replacement if 100 is 

unavailable, priority will be given 

to bidder offering 100)

4 Atomos ATOMXMINI1000PK  AtomX SSDmini (1TB) EA. $195.40 $781.60 $343.91 $1,375.64

101 1 PortaCom COM-40FC-D PortaCom COM-40FC 4 Headset Intercom System EA. $1,619.99 $1,619.99 $1,849.50 $1,849.50

102 2 Apple Mac Studio

Mac Studio computer with 24-core CPU, 60-core GPU, 

32-core Neural Engine, 128GB unified memory, 1TB 

SSD storage, Pro Apps Bundle for Education

EA. No Bid No Bid $3,799.05 $7,598.10

103 2 Apple Magic Keyboard Magic Keyboard for Mac Studio EA. No Bid No Bid $119.97 $239.94

104 2 Apple Magic Mouse Magic Mouse for Mac Studio EA. No Bid No Bid $73.47 $146.94

105 4 Apple USB-C to USB Adapter USB-C to USB Adapter EA. No Bid No Bid $17.33 $69.32

106 2 Apple USB-C Digital AV Multiport Adapter USB-C Digital AV Multiport Adapter EA. No Bid No Bid $62.72 $125.44

107 2 Atto TLFC-3162-D00
Dual 40Gb Thunderbolt to Dual 16Gb FC Adapter 

(SFPs included)
EA. $2,148.79 $4,297.58 $2,029.35 $4,058.70

108 1 Installation Installation and various cables EA. No Bid No Bid $105.00 $105.00

109 2 Netgear GSM4212P-100NAS
Netgear AV Line M4250 GSM4212P 8-Port Gigabit 

PoE+ Compliant Managed AV Switch with SFP (125W)
EA. $496.38 $992.76 $523.35 $1,046.70

110 1 Netgear GSM4210PD-100NAS
Netgear AV Line M4250 GSM4210PD 8-Port Gigabit 

PoE+ Compliant Managed AV Switch with SFP (110W)
EA. $479.02 $479.02 $514.77 $514.77

111 1 Ubiquiti USW-24-POE
Ubiquiti Networks UniFi 24-Port Gigabit PoE+ Compliant 

Managed Switch with SFP
EA. $356.39 $356.39 $371.42 $371.42

112 2 Shure BRH441M-LC Shure Single-Sided Broadcast Headset EA. $145.00 $290.00 $162.06 $324.12

113 4 Shure BRH440M-LC Shure Dual-Sided Broadcast Headset EA. $159.00 $636.00 $182.40 $729.60

114 1 Blackmagic Design SWPANELADV1ME10 Blackmagic Design ATEM 1 M/E Advanced Panel EA. $2,669.85 $2,669.85 $2,617.15 $2,617.15

115 2 Jason Cases BDP240CPL BirdDog P240 Robos and Controller Case EA. $378.99 $757.98 $439.12 $878.24

116 1 Jason Cases BMATMNPL Jason Cases Pelican Case for Blackmagic ATEM Mini EA. $211.90 $211.90 $245.52 $245.52

117 1 Blackmagic Design HYPERD/AVIDA12/7HDR
Blackmagic Design Video Assist 7" 12G-SDI/HDMI 

HDR Recording Monitor
EA. $863.66 $863.66 $875.60 $875.60

118 2 Watson B-4205
Watson NP-F770 Lithium-Ion Battery Pack (7.4V, 

4400mAh)
EA. $18.00 $36.00 $33.99 $67.98

119 3 Middle Atlantic PWR-9-RPM
Middle Atlantic PWR-9-RPM Essex Rackmount Power 

Distribution w/ Surge Protection and Meter (9 Outlets)
EA. $109.95 $329.85 $110.00 $330.00

120 4 ShooterSlicker S7 BLACK (MFR# MTO-S7-BK)
ShooterSlicker S7 Elephant Overnight Bag - Protection 

for S5 & S10 Style Cameras - Black
EA. $526.00 $2,104.00 $463.14 $1,852.56

121 1 Promise Technologies P32R8HD32US
Promise Technology Pegasus32 R8 32TB 8-Bay 

Thunderbolt 3 / USB 3.2 Gen 2 RAID Array (8 x 4TB)
EA. $2,720.81 $2,720.81 $2,789.07 $2,789.07

122 4 Manfrotto 438
Manfrotto 438 Compact Leveling Head - Ball Camera 

Leveler
EA. $89.00 $356.00 $116.99 $467.96

123 4 Manfrotto 028B
Manfrotto 028B Triman Camera Tripod with Geared 

Center Column
EA. $399.00 $1,596.00 $467.96 $1,871.84

124 4 Manfrotto MVH500AH Manfrotto MVH500AH Fluid Video Head with Flat Base EA. $139.90 $559.60 $183.95 $735.80

125 4 Ruggard BD-3035 Ruggard Deluxe Padded 35" Tripod Case (Black) EA. $22.00 $88.00 $28.66 $114.64

126 2 Axler PSR-44 Axler Portable Medium Duty Shooting Riser (4' x 4') EA. $429.00 $858.00 $479.20 $958.40

127 2 Acer UM.HB2AA.005
Acer CB2 Series CB272U smiiprx 27" Monitor HDR 

FreeSync IPS Monitor
EA. $149.00 $298.00 $161.49 $322.98

128 1 OWC OWCTB3F1U1S092
92.0TB (4x8.0TB NVMe + 3x20.0TB HDD) Flex 1U4 4-

Bay Rackmount Thunderbolt Storage, Docking & PCIe 

Expansion Solution

EA. $6,838.09 $6,838.09 $6,867.99 $6,867.99

129 1 OWC AKTPCIE10GB
AKiTiO 5-Speed 10Gb/s Ethernet

PCIe Expansion Card
EA. No Bid No Bid $101.19 $101.19

130 6 Shieldrock SRCAB-SCX0040-6FT
ShieldRock 12G-SDI BNC to HD-BNC 4K UHD Cable 

(6')
EA. $28.21 $169.26 $30.22 $181.32

131 1 Yamaha MS101-4 Powered speaker EA. $110.96 $110.96 $122.39 $122.39

132 1 Magewell 531300000 Magewell Ultra Encode AIO EA. $693.53 $693.53 $655.18 $655.18

133 1 Sony ILME-FX3 Sony FX3 Full-Frame Cinema Camera EA. $3,508.20 $3,508.20 $3,782.99 $3,782.99

134 1 Sony SEL1635GM2 FE 16-35 MM F 2.8 GM II Lens EA. $2,050.00 $2,050.00 $2,184.99 $2,184.99

135 1 Sony SEL2470GM2 FE 24-70 MM F 2.8 GM Lens EA. $2,048.00 $2,048.00 $2,184.99 $2,184.99

136 1 Sony SEL24F14GM FE 24 MM F 1.4 GM Lens EA. $1,148.00 $1,148.00 $1,329.99 $1,329.99

137 1 Sony SEL50F12GM FE 50 MM F 1.2 GM Lens EA. $1,648.00 $1,648.00 $1,899.99 $1,899.99

138 1 Sony SEL85F14GM FE 85 MM F 1.4 GM Lens EA. $1,498.00 $1,498.00 $1,709.99 $1,709.99

139 4 Sony NPFZ100 Z-Series Rechargeable Battery Pack EA. $52.00 $208.00 $55.99 $223.96

140 2 Sony BC-QZ1 Battery Charger for NPFZ100 Batteries EA. $65.00 $130.00 $69.99 $139.98

141 2 Sony MRWG2 CFExpress Type A / SD Card Reader EA. $104.00 $208.00 $113.99 $227.98

142 4 Sony CEBG256/J CFExpress Type B Tough Memory Card EA. $235.00 $940.00 $408.49 $1,633.96

143 1 LowePro LP37177-GRL ProTactic BP 450 AW II (Black) Camera Bag EA. $199.00 $199.00 $229.99 $229.99

144 1 Sirui SCH-FX3/30 Sirui Full Camera Cage with Handle EA. $68.00 $68.00 $82.00 $82.00

145 1 Sony XLR-H1 Sony XLR-H1 XLR Handle Unit EA. $569.00 $569.00 $599.99 $599.99

146 1 Andycine A6 Lite
ANDYCINE A6 Lite 5" Full HD HDMI Input/Output 

Monitor with 4K Support/DC Out /Tilt Arm
EA. $109.00 $109.00 $138.58 $138.58

147 3 Watson B-4205
Watson NP-F770 Lithium-Ion Battery Pack (7.4V, 

4400mAh), batteries for Andycine monitor
EA. $18.00 $54.00 $32.79 $98.37

148 1 Watson DX-4203
Watson Duo LCD Charger for L & M Series 

Rechargeable Batteries, charger for Watson batteries
EA. $39.00 $39.00 $65.57 $65.57

149 2 LaCie STFR5000800

LaCie 5TB Rugged USB 3.1 Gen 1 Type-C External 

Hard Drive,

Harddrives for Storing Media from Video Shoots

EA. $161.88 $323.76 $170.99 $341.98

150 1 K-Tek KE-89CC
K-Tek KE-89CC Avalon Series Aluminum Boompole 

with Internal XLR Cable, 2'5" - 7'6" with Bottom Output
EA. $139.00 $139.00 $170.07 $170.07


